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Organize Polio Group
At Clarenceville

A meeting to organize a chapter
_of the National Foundation .for
Infantile Paralysis will be held July
11 at Clarenceville High School, it
was announced this week.

The meeting, to.begin at § pm.,
will be under the chairmanship of
Mrs. T. K. Allen of 19420 Park-
ville. The National Foundation for
Infantile  Pavalysis  (March . of
Dimes) will be represented.

The Don Reynolds and sons of

Detroit were Sunday evening call-
ers nt the Hugh Mcintyre home.

Enrollment Grows

(Continued trom Page One)

oou with a baton twirling class on
Vednesday, July 11. .
This Friday students will take a
rip to the TwinPines Dairy and
he Detroit Art Museum. The bifs:
s will leave the Clarencesille High
chool at 9:00 am. On July 12 a
ccond group will make the same
rip. . Students must Tegister for
he trips. The ! clementary pro-
ram will be conducted at the
Edgewood Schoolinext -Monday, the
Central School o Tuesday and the

bther two lots on Wednesday.
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Jerry Plum Awarded
Wayne S_cho]arship :

5 RIER

FRITIIIIITIEy

Eastern Star

WEDNESDAY, JULY 11 °

12:30 p.m. Blue Star Mothers
2:00 p.m. Women's Guild

6:30 pm. Kiwanis Club .
8£:00 po. C'vitle Polio Meeting

COMMUNITY E
CALENDAR of EVENTS

TSI I mpmmmmnnTIn

: THURSBPAY, JULY 5
$:00 p.m. American Legion Leglion Hall

. MONDAY, JULY 3
$:00 p.m. Farmington School Board Supérintendent’s Office
$:00 p.m. Clarenceville School Board Clarenceville High School
$:15 p.m.  Daughters of Isabellz Town Hall
§:30 pm.  Amerlean Leglon Auxillary — Leglon Hall
TUESDAY, JULY 10

Lions Club - The .Butfet

Men’s Club Methiodist Church

‘Township Board Town Hall .

Masonic Temple

Home of Mrs. H. Fawcett,
35615 Grand River

Salem Church

Salem Church
Clarencevilte High School

GERALD PLUM

Gerald Plum, 1851 Farmington
High School graduate and son of
Mr. and Mrs. Irving E. Plum of
3115 Shiawassee. will accept &

Universalist Church History_
e e

(Continued from Page One)
man slavery. By the Northwest
Ordinance, slavery was perpetual
Iy outtawed. Farmington people
were for the most part unalterably
opposed o the slave traffic. Many

was

and

nion s
fered him by Wayne University.
The scholarship provides’ tuition
and fees for one year and s spon-
sored by Mackenzie - Union, men’s
student government association at
the University. Plum pians to pur-
sue a pre-medical course at Wayne.

OMFORT”
Feature will Start about 8:30 p.m.
¥ — Continuous Shaws from 1:00 p.an.
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Custard Fits In
Many Meal Plans

: Custard is a dessert that Should
be considered “special” jn many
ways, says Mary Morr of the foods!
and nutrition department. of the
Michigan State College school of!
home economics. 1t's often consid:
ered a part of softyor bland diets,

1a bell in partnership. Co-operation!

were vigorously a in their:
views, and some, irrespective of re:
ligious opinions, actively helped
fugitive slaves to esciupe from thé
South to Canada.

Freedum of religion went hand
in hand with friendly co-operation
in emergencies. Churches on occa-
sion shared each other’s houses of
worship. Two congregations bought

Mr.

But more of that later. :
One, of the striking instances of
and

able and excellent man — so king

jestic in demeanor, yet quiet as
a woman, and affable and brotherly
toward all.”

When he “heard, in the 1840's.
that the Rev. E. M. Waoolley had
arrived
was
groups in Pontiac and Birmingham,

Farmington.
was preaching occasionally in a
room over George Wright's wagon
shop. -

The precise date of the first Uni-
versalist services was not record-
ed, but contemporary writings show

described by a friend as “an

benignant of countenance, ma-

in Oakland County and
preacing to Universalist
Lyon implored him to come to
Sooft  Mr. Woolley

dif-that the

ference of opinfon cropped up in
1836, only 12 vears after the first
white settler felled his first tree.
BARN RAISING

The township's first barn-raising:
without-whisky was in progress on
the farm of a Fundamentalist min:
Ister near what is now Farmington

but in reality wif fit in with any]
diet, she advisefl i

Custard is highly putritious since!
it is prepared from milk and eggs.
It fs very easy to prepare’ either
as a baked custard or as a stirred
custard. It is relatively inexpen:
sive to serve in relation to its muj
tritive value. . H

Another feature of cusiards is
often overlooked, Miss Morr says;
it is the fact that custard can be
adapted to many combinations td
give variety to desserts. - i

Stirred custard, served plain, 18
at its best it it is thoroughly chill
ed before it is served. The chill;
ing seems to bring out the creamy
goodness of the custard. It should
be kept cold right up to the timd
it is served at the table.  Stirred
custard lends itselt to excellent
combinations of cakes or fruits, :

A particularly refreshing spring!
Hike dessert Is made by serving
well-chilled soft . custard ovet
sponge cake or lemon chitfon cake;
The fresh strawberry season offery
an - excellent chance to pour soft
custard over angel cake and gar;
nish with a liberal portlon of sweetl
ened strawberries, ]

It you are a homemaker who likes
to bake her own angel food cakes,
don’t forget that the egg yolks are
left, the perfect -beginning for the
creamy stirred custard to servé
with the cake. You recall that two
egg yolks have the thickening pow:
er of one whole egg. |

See Decline In
-Breeding Stock

Sharptall grouse and’ prairie
chicken breeding stock appears to
be down 10 to 30 per cent this year
as compared to last year, accord-
ing to a spring survey of northern
courtship areas by conservation
department fleld men. :

The spring observations 'may on-
Iy refiect a temporary -setback,
however game men do not exclude
the possibility that this ‘may be
the start of the downward trend in
the population cycle. . |

Sharptails, most numerous of the
two species, are belleved down
about-10 per cent in their upper
and northern lower peninsula range.
About 60 per cent more: actually
were observed on Drummond fsland
dancing grounds, about the same
number in the eastern upper pen-
insula, but fewer in the, western
upper ~ peninsula, particularly in
the Sturgeon River state forest. :

In the northern lower peninsula,
fewer sharptalls were checked in
the * previously abundant ares,
southeastern Kalkaska County. New
colonies showed up in northeastern
Kalkaska, eastern Antrim anod
southern Otsego counties. Nearly
100 Canadian sharptals were stock-
ed In Otsego two years ago. An-
other possible explanation is that
a tew of the extra colonfes in these
countles might be birds which scat-
tered from the open season coun-
tles below. : :

Less favorable was the 30 per
cent apparent decrease in praire
chicken numbers in all the north-
ern lower peninsula range . . . ot
Jist in the four counties open to
chicken and sharptail bunting last
fall, Kalkaska, Crawford, Roscom-
mon and Missaukee. t

Bituminous coal contributed 44ﬁ8
per cent of the total energy con-
sumed in its competitive market
in 1950. '

and Thirteen Mile Roads- Neigh-
bors from miles around gathered
to help.

In the course of the work, an
early chronicler records, “an in-
surmountabte obstacle was encount-
ered.” '

Frank N. Steele's father, Carlos,
recounted that the workmen would
pull and tug on a heavy log in an
effort to raise it to the ridgepole,
but at the crucial moment theif
strength seemed to give way and
the timber would fall to the ground.

One of the neighbors who was
helping erect the barn was Orange
Culver, who lived about a mile
north on the Town Line Road.

Little has come down to us about
Orange Culver except that he was
a native of Wayne County, New
York, and that he and George Cul-
ver, presumably a brother, came’to
Farmington Township {n 1825. °

Whether Orange Culver approv-
ed.of whisky Is not recorded. Per-
haps he disapproved of it. But he
was most certalnly a practical

an. -

Furthermore, we know that he
did not believe that a man would
be condemned to everlasting tor-
ment if he took a drink now and
then, especially when putting up a

ing

the

ning to gain @ foothold in the
1840's. .

Mr. Lyon later adapted the old
Red Store of George W. Collins
(where the Clvic
stands) for use as a schoolroom.
In that building Hervey P. Dailey
taught ciasses and, when school
was not in session, Mr. Woolley
preached.

Mr. Woolley was a “clrcuit rid-
er”; that is, he traveled from con-
gregation to congregation. usually
on horseback and often under try-

pel.

How many churches he visited
on his circuit is not recorded. By
1849,
had 35 societies in Michigan, only
tive of which "had built meeting-
houses.
Woolley spoke in numerous places.

One minister of this day travel-
ed 2 13l-mile circvit in Oakland
County every four weeks, preaching
31 times a ‘monuth for $120 a year
“in anything but money”.

Mr. Lyon was imbued with a
great fdea: to establish a liberal 3
church in which members of any
faith would be welcome. R
- He had good reason for not des-
ignating the church as Universalist,
for that was a term used by Funda.
mentalists .as an epithet of con-| |
tempt. (The “heretic” Universal-
ists, on the other hand, referred to

thefr lellet that only-the chosen
tew could enter heaven, as Par-

was begin-

Theater how

CIRCUIT RIDER

conditigns, to spread the Gos-

nowever, the Universalists
trip.
One may assume that Mr.

Zoa.
ber

torf

Fundamentalists, because of

Lot

operation.

furjough from Camp

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Matbews of
12 Mile Road have announced the
engagement of their daughter, Char-
lotte Ann, to James E. Yuill, son
of Mr. and Mrs. J. Yuill of Macomb
Avenue. The wedding date has not
been détermined.

Expect To Complete City
Hall Repair Next Week

‘Work. is expected te be complet-
ed early next week on the repair of
the front of the Farmington Muni-
cipal - Building, it was announced
Monday. :

‘Workmen: are speeding comple-
tion_of the repair work so that the
barricade can be removed and the
building can be put back in normat
At the present time the
main entrance is blocked and cus-
tomers must use the side door.
Last week all of the loose con-
crete was removed prior to water-
proofing. ‘The front of the huild-
ing: is being caulked and water-
proofed and a new sandstone col-
ored paint added.

Summer Program
. (Continued trom Page Oue)
the Farmington School at 12
There will be a 35¢ charge the first
day and 25c thereafter.
ure hunt will be held at all the
playgrounds on Friday for those
who do not make the swimming

n Monday youngsters from all
playgrounds will visit the Detroit

Because only a limited num- ‘
can go, younugsters are request- H
ed to register for the trip at their
playground. On Tuesday, Farming-
playground youngsters will go
to Kent Lake for Red Cross swim-{| -
ming. All of the playgrounds will 1
remaln open for children who do|| !
not go swimming, A trip to Green-
field Village will be held on Wed-
day and on Thursday youngsters
trom the Bond, Noble.and William || * i !
ce Schools will go to Kent Lake ' i
Red Cross swimming. )

William F. Long is visiting his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Herbert C.
g. at 33925 Grand River on 2
McCoy, Wis-|| /

A treas-

Jendritz Attends Lions

Jobin Jendritz represented;
Farniington Lions Club last

International Convention held
Atlatitic City.

A total of 16,000 delegates
14,000 guests attended the co
tion,. making it the largest

the expansive line-up of 8,765
ber organizations of the In

General
headquarters,

ristown;
winter and

tory;of the United States.

LOCALS

Miss Anne Dwyer was a D
caller Suturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Lenz, M
Mrs; Milow Balow, and Mr.
Mrs, Robert. Brown attende
balli game at Briggs ‘Stadium
the Fourth of July.

Mr. and Mrs.

coda, Michigan, where Mr.

hus!nes&

International Convention

week
at the organization's 34th Aonual

and
ven-
ever
staged by the Lions International.
Representatives from 31 couritries
on five continents were' present in
mem-
erna-

to Philadeiphia; Valley Forge;|Mor-
Washington’s
other
points of interest in the early his-

troit

. and

George Haskell
and; daughter have moved to-Os-
2 Has-
kell: will continue in the building

and 80LD and INSTALLED
the FOHOA i
on AVAILABLE
‘H. R, TRACY
29200 Greening

Summer Band

(Continued from Page One) .

25. During that event they will
perform.a_special dance enroute.

Farmington’s summer band pro-
in|gram will commence on Mozday,
July 23. Begioning and advanced
students will be given instruction
on all hand instruments. Tnstrue-
tion will be given at the Bond and
Noble Schools as well as the Farm-
ington Band House. A definite
registration schedule will appear
next week.

The annual beat trip is scheduled

the

tional Assoclation of Lions Glubs.| o HonLo lsland this year on
Jehdritz stated that in the last|Wednesday, July 23. Keego.Har-
fiscal year 806 mew ciubs were|por, Clarenceville and >Milford
formed. The Lions International |ywill participate in addition to the
was founded in 1917. Jendritz was|Farmington band and recreation
president of the Farmingten Lions | groups. :
for the year 1950 - 51.
After the _convention, Mr.| and
Mrs. Jendritz continued on a trip

WELL
DRILLING

WELL REPAIR —
—__ PUMP SERVICE

ELECTRIC PUMPS | .

Telephone MAyfalr 62492
g il

Ecohomy
_|| Durability

. . P
tion insures minim
cost. .

Complete Blue

Cement block construction offers you more than
other building materials.
um upkeep and thereby cuts

Prints and Specifications
Available for Your Builder

Consult Us For
‘Steel Sash — Transit Mix Concrete — Mortar — Sand ~ Gr:
Peerless Cement rain: — Other Related Products .-

;Fenldt Builders’ Supplies

22005 Gill Road

CEMENT BLOCli!(
CONSTRUCTION

Offers You More
‘e . Fuel Saving
o FireResistance

Its durable construe-

el

 Phone 1975

barn. In the first place, he did|tjalists.)

not belleve in the Fundamentalists’| M. Lyan selected the name Un-|consin.
hell, for Orange Culver was a Unk jjon Church, adopting the title from
versallst. . the celebrated book “Unfon” writ-

At any rate, being a practical |ten a century earlier by the Rev.
man, Mr. Culver went home and|james Relly of London, which crys-
came back with four men and & Jug. |tallized Universelist thought.

Soon, the history states, all the
heavy timbers were in place and| (Copyricht 1031 by Chester E. Downlng.
every peg driven home. - {Siiiear, MR, DU B

Differences of opinion in reli-}granted without charge to religious fo-
glous matters arose early in the |cicties on application)
township. By the 1840's four The mext Instalment:  The
churches were functioning. : bu(lldlng of a church house and

FIRST SOCIETY Sedication)

The Presbyterians were the first -
to organize, August 13, 1826, at the
house of Amos Mend, later town-
ship supervisor. The society built
the townehip's first church edifice
in 1833 on land that was later the
Francis Courter farm, at Halsted .
and Eleven Mile Roads.

The Baptists orgenized later in Blue Star ,
1826. Charter members Included X
Deacon Samuel Mead, a brother of Mothers
Amos. The Baptists built in 1835 L. McINTYRE
& mile north of the
Church. ~— 3

The Methodists soon foilowed, in| The Blue Star Mothers are fnvit-

1829. The soclety once met in the [ing the public to a luncheon and
cooper shop of Joel Bostwick 4t card party to be held at 12:30 p.m.

the Territorfal Road (Shiawassee) [on July 11 at “Vista Villa®, the :
and’ Warner Street, and it was on |C. F. Smith estate ou Grand River 1
this site that the congregation ded- | Avenue, Mrs. Harrison Fawcett
feated a church in August 1844, will be hostess for the atfair.

Farmington was “Quakertown", s n— 8
and lh: Soctety of F;lends W88 0| America’s forests are the most
i;‘!“l’::y e“\’:g“r‘“?ﬂlws : ‘ﬁ"gf};&: productive in the world; Let's keep
and the first settler, donated a two- 'h:";h"e":‘ way by preventing for
acre site on what is now Gill Road.| %
for o church and burlal ground, A ‘
trame meetinghouse was buiit
there in 1832. The old Quaker S U ARE i
Cemetery Is still a landmark, .

Then came Sergius P. Lyon and
the Universalists, D AN C E -

Mr. Lyon was a remarkable man.

So important & part did he play in EVERY SATURDAY

the history of the Farmington Uni-
versalist Church that he deserves
specia] mention here.

He was born April 21, 1805, at
East Bloomfleld, N .Y. His parents
were orthodox Christians, but Ser-
glus, as a contemporary wrote, Was
“a born Universalist” and early es-
poused that faith. At 28 he mar-
rled Miss Lucinda W. Davis, afd
five years later, in 1837, they moved
to F

It pays to grow trees &8s o crop.!
Ask your mearest forester about

Mr. Lyon was &, hullder, a,manu-
facturer of self-regulating stoves

the American Tree Farm System.

WALTER HOTELEN

Phone
EMpire 3.5102

 NIGHT

JOHN GREEN

VIOLINIST

.CALLER
ADMISSION

75¢

But it causes us to s
We bust out like this just once a year
We won't go further so you've nothing to fear. -
We've told you already about the hams we've got

And the price on them is still really hot. "
Oh how about a roast from a lean pork loin? i
It's off the rib end and you don’t need much coin. -
For 39¢ a pound they're cheap — wouldn’t you say?
The cheapest meat you've found in many a day.
We have Conroy’s coffee at just 75¢ a pound,

It’s fresh from the roaster and never been ground. b
Don’t matter if yer pot’s a perc or a drip,
We'll spin the dial and let ’er rip. )
Suppose you'll want some potato salad, too.
‘Well, 'll tell yuh what you wanna do.
Stop around here and git yer eggs fresh
We're sellin’ *ém so fast it’s causin’ the hens alarm. :
Now the eggs are all boiled — the potaters are fixed, i
If you had some dressing you could git this thing mixed. :
We've got the dressing — the Salad Bowl brand.

For 49c a quart it’s really grand.

Now this is all done —- and you must agree
That you're mighty glad and so are we.
For as poets we stink — but then we did try.
And we'll not do it again “til next 4th of July.

PHONE 0340

You're lucky people — you know why?
Cause our ad is a poem each 4th of July.
It’s probably not the best you've ever read,

ratch our head.

from" the farm. -

and, much later, an-uidertaker. He

i

Traverse Hall
'1285 Union Lake Road
i
|

[



